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BUKHUN A.

CIVIL OBLIGATION OF STUDENTS IN THE CONTEXT OF EURO-INTEGRATING 
EDUCATIONAL CHANGES

The article, based on the methodological requirements of the personality-social, cultural, 
activity, axiological and competent scientific approaches, the results of content analysis of research 
materials on the issue of civic education of students in higher civilian and military educational 
institutions, determined the place (as an aspect of political consciousness and legal the personality 
culture) and the role (as a regulator of patriotic feelings, spiritual and moral values and the civic and 
political activity of a young person) civic the position of the individual in the context of modern 
European integration educational changes - updating the requirements for competence, tolerance, 
multiculturalism, strengthening of the phenomena of mobility and the integration of educational 
programs. The factors determining the formation and development of a civic position of a young person 
in the educational environment are defined: the circumstances of the construction and protection of civil 
society in the country, the influence of the family, the media, educational activities of higher educational 
institutions, the active activity of students and students, and its result - , legal awareness, civil 
competence.

The development of the civic position of student youth is considered in the context of European 
integration educational changes (updating the requirements for competence, tolerance, multiculturality 
of the individual, strengthening the phenomena of mobility and integration of educational programs of 
training specialists) and dynamic processes of finding a new identity in the context of domestic reforms 
and external military aggression, which determines the search ways of personal self-affirmation and 
self-realization of every young person on the basis of determining the measure of his own participation 
in public organizations and independent understanding of valuesof civil society. It is proved that a 
significant role in these processes belongs to the system of higher education of the country as a leading 
factor in civic education and education of youth, the specifics of which will be considered at the next 
stages of the study.

Key words: student youth, educational environment, citizenship, civic culture of the person, 
student's civic stance, European integration educational changes.
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